
Buyer:  Brenda Sensibaugh 6646 OF
Liquid Asphaltic Materials

NDOT

Opening Date: 02/22/22

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price
1 DISTRICT 1 CRS-2P 3920 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    646.05  $   2,532,516.00  No Bid  No Bid 
2 DISTRICT 3 CRS-2P 34670 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    662.42  $ 22,966,101.40  No Bid  No Bid 
3 DISTRICT 3 CSS-1H STRAIGHT 22 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    603.80  $        13,283.60  $   800.00  $      17,600.00  No Bid 
4 DISTRICT 3 HFE 150 1450 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    657.40  $      953,230.00  No Bid  No Bid 
5 DISTRICT 4 CRS-2P 7490 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $   632.00  $ 4,733,680.00  $    680.39  $   5,096,121.10  No Bid  No Bid 
6 DISTRICT 4 HFE 300 300 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    695.26  $      208,578.00  No Bid  No Bid 
7 DISTRCIT 4 MC-250 25 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    955.82  $        23,895.50  No Bid  No Bid 
8 DISTRICT 5 CRS-2P 540 TN  $ 691.49  $    373,404.60  No Bid  No Bid  $    725.05  $      391,527.00  No Bid  No Bid 
9 DISTRICT 5 CRS-2VHL 2255 TN  $ 681.49  $ 1,536,759.95  No Bid  No Bid  $    823.95  $   1,858,007.25  No Bid  $      735.65  $ 1,658,890.75 
10 DISTRICT 6 CRS-2P 3500 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $   644.00  $ 2,254,000.00  $    699.67  $   2,448,845.00  No Bid  No Bid 
11 DISTRICT 6 CSS-1H 50/50 80 TN  $ 395.99  $      31,679.20  No Bid  No Bid  $    440.78  $        35,262.40  $   800.00  $      64,000.00  No Bid 
12 DISTRICT 6 CSS-1H 75/25 2160 TN  $ 491.99  $ 1,062,698.40  No Bid  No Bid  $    552.13  $   1,192,600.80  $   840.00  $ 1,814,400.00  No Bid 
13 DISTRICT 6  HFE 300 720 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    720.05  $      518,436.00  No Bid  No Bid 
14 DISTRICT 6 MC-250 100 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    977.43  $        97,743.00  No Bid  No Bid 
15 DISTRICT 7 CRS-2P 2910 TN  No Bid  No Bid  $   672.00  $ 1,955,520.00  $    705.28  $   2,052,364.80  No Bid  No Bid 
16 DISTRICT 7 CSS-1H 50/50 90 TN  $ 407.99  $      36,719.10  No Bid  No Bid  $    462.72  $        41,644.80  $   800.00  $      72,000.00  No Bid 
17 DISTRICT 7 CSS-1H STRAIGHT 55 TN  $ 589.99  $      32,449.45  No Bid  No Bid  $    667.19  $        36,695.45  $   844.00  $      46,420.00  No Bid 
18 DISTRICT 8 CRS-2P 2325 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    672.25  $   1,562,981.25  No Bid  No Bid 
19 DISTRICT 8 CSS-1H 75/25 330 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    547.27  $      180,599.10  $   800.00  $    264,000.00  No Bid 
20 DISTRICT 8 HFE 300 375 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    690.82  $      259,057.50  No Bid  $      714.00  $    267,750.00 
21 DISTRICT 8 HFE 1000 50 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    789.51  $        39,475.50  No Bid  No Bid 
22 DISTRICT 8 MC-250 18 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    935.48  $        16,838.64  No Bid  No Bid 
23 CRS-2 STRAIGHT PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  $ 550.00  $    110,000.00  No Bid  No Bid  $    590.00  $      118,000.00  No Bid  No Bid 
24 CRS-2L PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  No Bid 
25 CRS-2P 80/20 PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  No Bid 
26 CSS-1H PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  $ 550.00  $    110,000.00  No Bid  No Bid  $    590.00  $      118,000.00  $   840.00  $    168,000.00  No Bid 
27 CSS-1H 75/25 PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  $ 465.00  $      93,000.00  No Bid  No Bid  $    490.00  $        98,000.00  $   800.00  $    160,000.00  No Bid 
28 CSS 1H 50/50 PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  $ 375.00  $      75,000.00  No Bid  No Bid  $    390.00  $        78,000.00  $   780.00  $    156,000.00  No Bid 
29 CSS 1H PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                     -    $   840.00  $    168,000.00  No Bid 
30 SS-1H 75/25 PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $      432.00  $      86,400.00 
31 SS-1H 50/50 PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $      302.00  $      60,400.00 
32 CFS/FS-1 PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  No Bid 
33 CMS-1 PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  No Bid 
34 CMS-1W PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  No Bid 
35 MC-250 PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    920.00  $      184,000.00  No Bid  No Bid 
36 HFE 150 PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    650.00  $      130,000.00  No Bid  $      595.00  $    119,000.00 
37 HFE 300 PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    675.00  $      135,000.00  No Bid  $      615.00  $    123,000.00 
38 HFE 500 PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $      617.00  $    123,400.00 
39  HFE 1000 PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    730.00  $      146,000.00  No Bid  $      675.00  $    135,000.00 
40 HFMS-2L PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  No Bid 
41 HFM-2P PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  No Bid 
42 CRS-2P PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    635.00  $      127,000.00  No Bid  No Bid 
43 CRS-2VHL PLANT PICK UP 200 TN  $ 665.00  $    133,000.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                     -    No Bid  $      680.00  $    136,000.00 
44 RETURNED LOAD FEE 1 MI  $   11.00  $             11.00 $0.00 $0.00 $12.00  $               12.00  $     10.00  $             10.00  $          4.00  $               4.00 
45 DEMURRAGE CHARGE 1 HR  $ 225.00  $           225.00 $0.00 $0.00 $240.00  $             240.00  $   350.00  $           350.00  $      110.00  $           110.00 

 $ 3,594,946.70  $ 8,943,200.00  $ 43,660,056.09  $ 2,930,780.00  $ 2,709,954.75 
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